
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 200400184 Invoice Date: 11/3/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916379

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Thu, Nov 6, 2025 at 08:48 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott's B0003237, invoice #200400184

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay Kennicott's B0003237, invoice #200400184, $83.66, thank you, Amy 
Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, November 6, 2025 2:44 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4268_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 200403240 Invoice Date: 11/5/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916377

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Thu, Nov 6, 2025 at 08:50 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott's B0003237, invoice #200403240

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay Kennicott's B0003237, invoice #200403240, $102.69, thank you, Amy 
Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, November 6, 2025 2:45 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4271_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600289082 Invoice Date: 11/3/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916378

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Thu, Nov 6, 2025 at 08:52 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott's B0003237, invoice #600289082

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay, ok to pay Kennicott's B0003237, invoice #600289082, $188.14. Thank 
you, Amy Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, November 6, 2025 2:45 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4270_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600295523 Invoice Date: 11/10/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916374

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Mon, Nov 10, 2025 at 11:27 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay B0003237 Kennicott's invoice# 600295523

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

Please process the attached invoice ok to pay, B0003237 Kennicott’s #600295523, $226.58.  Thanks, Amy

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Monday, November 10, 2025 4:38 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4276_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600302412 Invoice Date: 11/17/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916370

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Tue, Nov 18, 2025 at 07:34 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice 600302412

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice 600302412, $457.98, thank you, Amy Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Tuesday, November 18, 2025 1:23 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4288_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600302405 Invoice Date: 11/17/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916382

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Tue, Nov 18, 2025 at 07:34 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice 600302405

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice 600302405, $145.00, thank you, Amy Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Tuesday, November 18, 2025 1:23 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4287_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 200418724 Invoice Date: 11/17/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916381

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Tue, Nov 18, 2025 at 07:35 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice 200418724

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice 200418724, $233.87, thank you, Amy Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Tuesday, November 18, 2025 1:23 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4289_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600305958 Invoice Date: 11/24/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916386

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Tue, Nov 25, 2025 at 10:17 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay B0003237 Kennicott invoice 600309598

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

Please process the attached invoice ok to payB0003237 Kennicott’s invoice 600309598 $378.10, thank 
you, Amy Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Monday, November 24, 2025 3:41 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4309_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600314992 Invoice Date: 12/1/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916385

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Mon, Dec 1, 2025 at 09:26 PM UTC

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice #600341992

"Hull, Amy" <hullamy@cod.edu>

CC: Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu>

BCC:

The attached invoice is ok to pay Kennicott B0003237 invoice #600341992, $111.95, thank you, Amy 
Hull

 

From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Monday, December 1, 2025 3:20 PMSent:

 Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>To:
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

1 attachment

4317_001.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 200437005 Invoice Date: 12/1/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916389

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Tue, Dec 2, 2025 at 01:48 PM UTC

Aubrey Switalski <aubreys@kennicott.com>

[External] Invoice 12/01/2025 200437005 B0003237 $548.50

 <aubreys@kennicott.com>Aubrey Switalski

CC: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 

Please see attached. Thank you for your purchase!

 Aubrey Switalski
 Office Manager,

 Kennicott

         3730 W. 131st St., Alsip, IL 60803 (708) 575-4677

         kennicott.com aubreys@kennicott.com

  

9 attachments

image005.png

4315_001.pdf



image004.png
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Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600305908 Invoice Date: 12/1/2025 PO Number:
P0020600 Voucher Number: V0916244

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Tue, Dec 2, 2025 at 01:50 PM UTC

Aubrey Switalski <aubreys@kennicott.com>

[External] Invoice 200437005- P0020600 Hort Club $2,010.90

 <aubreys@kennicott.com>Aubrey Switalski

CC: Rangel Gutierrez, Jacqueline <rangelj7781@cod.edu>, Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 

Please see attached. Thank you for your purchase!

 Aubrey Switalski
 Office Manager,

 Kennicott

         3730 W. 131st St., Alsip, IL 60803 (708) 575-4677

         kennicott.com aubreys@kennicott.com

  

 From: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu> 
 Monday, December 1, 2025 3:25 PM Sent:

 Aubrey Switalski <aubreys@kennicott.com> To:
 Rangel Gutierrez, Jacqueline <rangelj7781@cod.edu>; Gonzalez, Gabriel <gonzalezg147@cod.edu> Cc:

 invoice 200437005- P0020600 Hort ClubSubject:



 

Hi Aubrey, please send this invoice in to  and copy Jacqueline and me, thank you, Amyinvoicing@cod.edu

 

 From: Hull, Amy <  > hullamy@cod.edu
 Monday, December 1, 2025 3:20 PM Sent:

 Hull, Amy <  > To: hullamy@cod.edu
 Attached ImageSubject:

 

 

9 attachments
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image006.png

4316_001.pdf
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Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1494104 Vendor
Name: Kennicott Brothers Co.

Check Details:
Check Number: 0347202 Check Amount: $ 4,994.19 Check Date:
12/16/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 600277078 Invoice Date: 10/20/2025 PO Number:
B0003237 Voucher Number: V0916384

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1







Tue, Dec 9, 2025 at 02:11 PM UTC

Aubrey Switalski <aubreys@kennicott.com>

[External] Invoice 10/20/2025

 <aubreys@kennicott.com>Aubrey Switalski

CC: Hull, Amy <hullamy@cod.edu>

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Please see attached

 

 Aubrey Switalski
 Office Manager,

 Kennicott

         3730 W. 131st St., Alsip, IL 60803 (708) 575-4677

         kennicott.com aubreys@kennicott.com

  

9 attachments

image005.png
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4320_001.pdf
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